
Curt Davis
September 4, 1939 - October 29, 2024

Coleman Funeral Home of Olive Branch 
 

Curtis Lynn Davis, 85, of Rossville, TN, passed away on October 29, 2024. Friends are
invited to a visitation with the family on Friday, November 1, 2024 from 11:00 a.m. to 12:00
p.m. with the service to follow at 12:00 p.m., all at Brookside Church in Olive Branch, MS.
Pastor Marvin Tharnish will officiate. Interment will be held at a later date at West
Tennessee State Veterans Cemetery. 

Curt was born in Augusta, AR to Margerite and Milford Anderson Davis on September 4,
1939. He served honorably in the United States Army and was a member of Brookside
Church. Curt adored his wife, Peggy, and was her devoted caretaker. They enjoyed
traveling together, especially trips out west. Curt also found joy in his time spent outside
gardening and working on his landscaping. Another favorite pastime was any opportunity
he had with his children and grandchildren. As an Arkansas native, Curt loved his
Razorbacks. 

 

Left to cherish Curt’s memory is his wife, Peggy Jean Davis of Rossville; daughters,
Natalie Tharnish (Marvin) of Olive Branch, MS; Susanne Smith (David) of Batesville, MS;
and Julie Henderson (Lance) of Rossville; son, Greg Davis (Mary) of Rossville; sister,
Linda Fellows (David) of Fayetteville, AR; brother, Tom Davis (Judy) of Grenada, MS;
sister-in-law, Lynne Davis of Olive Branch; numerous grandchildren; a growing number of
great-grandchildren; many nieces and nephews; and the family dog, Zoey. 

 

Curt was preceded in death by his parents and brothers, Jim Davis and Larry Davis. 
 

In honor of Mr. Davis’ service to our country, the flag of the United States Army will be
flown at Coleman Funeral Home the day of the services. 

 

In lieu of traditional flowers, contributions can be made to Brookside Church (www.brooksi
dems.org). 



Online condolences may be made on Curt’s tribute wall at www.colemanfuneralhomeob.c
om.



Previous Events

Visitation

NOV 1. 11:00 AM - 12:00 PM (CT)

Brookside Church
4993 MS-302 East
Olive Branch, MS 38654

Funeral Service

NOV 1. 12:00 PM (CT)

Brookside Church
4993 MS-302 East
Olive Branch, MS 38654



Tribute Wall

SW

Coleman Funeral Home (Olive Branch) - Yesterday at 06:11 PM

Coleman Funeral Home of Olive Branch created a Tribute Video in memory of
Curt Davis

Sandi & John Wallace - Yesterday at 01:35 PM

Sandi & John Wallace purchased the Simply Elegant
Spathiphyllum for the family of Curt Davis.

Coleman Funeral Home (Olive Branch) - Yesterday at 01:03 PM

100 files added to the album LifeTributes

https://www.colemanfuneralhomeob.com/store/Product.aspx?ProductId=1478&icn=desktop_tribute_wall_product_link&icc=fs_store#chooser
https://www.colemanfuneralhomeob.com/store/Product.aspx?ProductId=1478&icn=desktop_tribute_wall_product_link&icc=fs_store#chooser
https://www.colemanfuneralhomeob.com/store/Product.aspx?ProductId=1478&icn=desktop_tribute_wall_product_link&icc=fs_store#chooser

